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Across

1. Franciscan Srs. of St. Elizabeth, 
initially

5. "Eri tu" e.g. (Verdi)

9. Thirteen New Testament books 
are attributed to him

13. St. Albert proved to be one 
through his study of Greek and 
Arabian scholars

15. "The Ammonites marched out 
and ___ up for battle..." (2 Sam 
10:8)

17. St. Albert was this kind of 
friar

18. "...for to him all are ___." (Luke 
20:38)

19. Laban tricked Jacob into 
marrying her

20. ___ grass

22. St. Matthew Le ___ Gam, 
martyr (d.1847, f.5-11)

23. St. Marianne ___, "successor" 
to St. Damien of Molokai

26. Book before Esth.

28. In "The Divine ___," St. 
Albert is portrayed as one of the 
great lovers of wisdom in the 
Heaven of the Sun

30. "Quiet!"

31. Pierre-Jean ___, Jesuit 
missionary known as "Friend of 
Sitting Bull"

33. Apostolic and patristic, e.g.

34. Cover story?

36. "The eye that mocks a father, or 
___ the homage due a mother, Will 
be plucked out by brook ravens..." 
(Prov 30:17)

38. City in Germany where St. 
Albert founded its oldest 
university

41. Pope Urban IV had St. Albert 
preach the "eighth" in German-
speaking countries

44. St. Kieran of Saighir is this 
diocese's patron

46. The world, figuratively (John 
8:23)

47. Cistercians of the Strict 
Observance, initially

49. "When you hear ___ and 
insurrections, do not be terrified..." 
(Luke 21:9)

52. Having four sharps, musically

53. St. Albert's famous pupil 
from Aquino

55. ___ Jima

56. Nicholas II, for one

57. Call on

58. ___ culpa

60. Lo-___, child of Hosea

62. "...and bestowed ___ the name 
that is above every name..." (Phil 
2:9)

64. Because St. Albert studied 
botany, astronomy, minerology, 
physiology, etc., he is considered 
the greatest "natural" one of his 
day

69. "I have ___ fool spreading his 
roots..." (Job 5:3)

70. Subject of St. Albert's "De 
Fato"

71. ___ Hubbard, founder of 
Scientology

72. Mexican money

73. Treebeard and Quickbeam, 
notably

Down

1. "...in all things I have learned the 
secret of being well ___ and of 
going hungry..." (Phil 4:12)

2. Grey Nuns of the Cross, initially

3. "Domine, non ___ dignus..." 
(Non Sum Dignus)

4. St. ___, Quebec City (named for 
a martyr of Carthage)

5. St. Benedict of ___, monastic 
reformer (d.821, f.2-12)

6. "Oh, the depth of the ___ and 
wisdom and knowledge of God!" 
(Rom 11:33)

7. "Rather, one ___ Jew 
inwardly..." (Rom 2:29)

8. "I open my mouth and speak of 
her: gain wisdom for yourselves 
___ cost." (Sir 51:25)

9. Dialogue writer

10. Feel awful

11. St. Albert is known as 
"Doctor ___"

12. William Joseph ___, former 
Cardinal Archbishop of San 
Francisco (d.2019)

14. Dir. from Turin to Milan

16. Patron saint of France

21. Jim Caviezel or Jonathan 
Roumie, e.g.

23. Pallotine Srs. of the Catholic 
Apostolate, initially

24. St. Hallvard is this city's patron

25. St. Albert was the Christian 
Scholastic kind

27. Pinafore letters

29. "___ Maio" (1965 Paul VI 
encyclical)

31. Archeological sites

32. Book after Prov

35. Lazarus found comfort at 
Abraham's

37. Massages

39. Haman's last neck tie?

40. About a half acre

42. ___ Nobis Pacem

43. The America's Cup trophy, e.g.

45. Northumbrian saint of 
Lindisfarne

47. Four Holy Roman emperors, 
namely

48. St. Peter ___, priest and martyr 
(d.1841, f.4-28)

50. "For creation ___ with eager 
expectation the revelation of the 
children of God." (Rom 8:19)

51. St. Oscar ___, Archbishop and 
Martyr (d.1980, f.3-24)

54. Capital of Jordan

56. Monsignor, e.g.

59. P.D.Q.

61. LP connection?

63. "___ longer deserve to be called 
your son..." (Luke 15:19)

65. Carmelite Sisters of the 
Eucharist, initially

66. Euripides play

67. ___ Pepper

68. Cobb and Burrell, notably
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