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Across

1. Father of King David

6. Hebrew letter

10. St. ___, town in Cornwall 
England named for the Irish St. Ia

14. Dunedain's kingdom (LOTR)

15. Root meaning of "catechism"

16. Golden rule beginning

17. Order to which St. Junipero 
Serra belonged

19. Cistercians of the Strict 
Observance, initially

20. “Put out into deep water and 
lower your nets ___ catch.” (Luke 
5:4)

21. "A ___ swayed by the wind?" 
(Mat 11:17)

22. Sermon on the ___ (Lk 6)

23. "For you alone ___ the Holy 
One"

24. "Rise Up, O ___ of God"

25. Thomas Jefferson, religiously

27. First mission set up by St. 
Junipero Serra in the U.S.

29. Like many hymns written on 
guitar

32. "Rise up, ___ of the earth; give 
the proud what they deserve!" (Ps 
94:2)

35. "The jar of flour shall not go 
empty, nor the ___ of oil run 
dry..." (1 Kgs 17:14)

36. Crucifix

37. Church choir section

38. Greek letters

39. Second bishop of Dallas, 
Edward ___

40. Like Solomon, financially

41. Hebrew letters

42. One's child by baptism?

43. Rome's ___ Pacis

44. Where Mission San Carlos 
Borromeo was founded

46. Father of St. Junipero Serra?

48. "The birds of the ___"

49. "___ to the cities of Judah: Here
is your God!" (Is 40:9)

52. "___, Lord?" Last Supper 
question (Mat 26:22, DR)

54. Psalm accompaniment, at times

56. "For our God is a consuming 
___." (Heb 12:29)

57. Dominic ___, renowned 
Spanish theologian (d.1560)

58. St. Junipero Serra is its 
patron

60. "... it struck its ___ and clay 
feet, breaking them in pieces." (Dan
2:34)

61. Mission San ___ Capistrano, 
founded by St. Junipero Serra in 
1776

62. Midafternoon prayers

63. Father of Eber (Gen 10:24, DR)

64. Missionary Sisters of the 
Mother of God, initially

65. "___ High, when I am afraid, in 
you I place my trust." (Ps 56:3-4)

Down

1. Israeli port next to Tel Aviv

2. Item in a certain syllabus?

3. "He will rescue you from the 
fowler’s ___..." (Ps 91:3)

4. "What father among you would 
hand his ___ snake when he asks 
for a fish?" (Luke 11:11)

5. St. ___ of Slane, Irish druid 
convert of St. Patrick (d.513, 
f.11-2)

6. "May ___ you help from the 
sanctuary, from Zion be your 
support." (Ps 20:3)

7. "___ homo" (Pilate declaration)

8. One of the Twelve, a.k.a. Jude

9. Babe

10. False gods

11. Serra International's 
apostolate

12. "___ Nos" (1882 Leo XIII 
encyclical)

13. “Behold, I am coming ___.” 
(Rev 22:7)

18. Saintly widow of the martyr St. 
Castulus

22. St. Padre ___

24. Wise men from the east

26. "Or hand him a scorpion when 
he asks for an ___?" (Luke 11:12)

27. Society Devoted to the Sacred 
Heart, initially

28. "___ Came to Praise the Lord" 
(1988 hit song by The Imperials)

30. Something forbidden

31. Garden planted by God

32. "...concebido por ___ y gracia 
del Espíritu Santo..." (Credo 
Apostolico)

33. Manassite who captured all the 
region of Argob (Deut (3:14)

34. St. Junipero Serra is one of 
five Catholics found in its 
Statuary Hall

36. Catholic actor Sean Astin's title 
role in this 1993 film

38. Corrupt High Priest in 2 Mac 4

39. "...not a hearer who forgets but 
a ___ who acts..." (Jas 1:25)

41. Mount of Aaron's burial

42. "A ___ Observed" (C.S. Lewis 
work)

44. Year that Michelangelo began 
work on "David"

45. "The Son of Man came ___ and 
drinking..." (Luke 7:34)

47. Do penance

49. "Tremble and ___ more..." (Ps 
4:5)

50. Astrological ram

51. Passover no-no

52. Egyptian fertility goddess

53. St. Dominic of ___, OSB, abbot 
and founder (d.1031, f.1-22)

55. Son of Sheresh (1 Chr 7:16)

56. "But deliver us ___ evil."

58. Eudists, initially

59. Town of Judah, in a plain of the 
same name (Neh 6:2)
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