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Across

1. Michael J. ___, Bishop 
of San Angelo, Texas

4. Servants of the Blessed 
Sacrament, initially

7. "The ___ of Christ" 
(Thomas a Kempis classic)

10. With 20 and 32 
across, Our Lady of 
Guadalupe's words of 
comfort to Juan Diego

11. Babylonian astrological 
time span of 2000 years

12. Cherub, in Cherbourg

13. Unclean lizards (Lev 
11:30)

17. Byzantine chalice veil

18. Wipes clean

20. See 10 across

22. Leah's firstborn

24. Angels' and Padres' 
org.

27. Winter Olympics event

29. Dynamic start

31. Srs. of St. Agnes, 
initially

32. See 10 across

36. "When I send Artemas 
to you, or Tychicus, try to 
join me at ___, where I 
have decided to spend the 
winter." (Titus 3:12)

37. Garden party?

38. Servants of Our Lady, 
Queen of the Clergy, 
initially

Down

1. It might be venial

2. "Am ___ die for this?" 
(1 Sam 14:43)

3. What Jesus often did as 
he taught

4. Home of Sts. Catherine 
and Bernardine

5. "Mit Brennender ___" 
(1937 Pius XI encyclical)

6. "...they ___ at all who 
oppose them." (Ps 10:5)

7. "In the ___ and likeness 
of God"

8. "___ Vos" (1832 
Gregory XVI encyclical)

9. "Marana ___" (Come, 
Lord)

10. Son of Abijam, King of 
Judah (1 Kings 15:8)

14. Bryn ___, prestigious 
women's college in 
Pennsylvania

15. "From ___ to the 
Living Font"

16. Andrew Kim is patron 
of Catholics in this city

19. St. Stephen of Mar ___, 
nephew of St. John 
Damascene

21. Ancestor of Jesus 
(Luke 3:24)

23. "They have ears but do 
not hear, ___ but do not 
smell." (Ps 115:6)

24. St. Cuthbert ___, priest 
and martyr (d.1577, 
f.11-30)

25. Pope after Sergius II

26. Springsteen, practicing 
Catholic rock star

28. ___ Saba, ancient 
monastery overlooking the 
Kidron Valley

30. Pizarro's quest

33. AWOL chasers

34. Liturgy of the Hours 
abbr.

35. R.N.'s forte
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